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Mission Sends 

Four Members 
To Liberia 

' Four members of the Klay Li- 
beria Mission. Club will arrive in 
Las Palmas, Liberia, West Africa 
within the next two weeks, Mrs. 
Georgia DeB. Faulkner Carr, vice 
president and secretary announced 
this week, 

The members, Rey. and Mrs. E 
L. Timberlic and Mr. and Mrs. Mc- 
Clendon, were honored last week 
at a farewell reception and shower, 
where they gave cutlines of their 
objectives among Liberian natives. 

Rev. and Mrs. Timberlic sailed 
for Liberia last week and Mr: end 
Mrs. McClendon will Ieave this 
country by plane April 12, 

At the reception President Amos 
M. Mereditn gave a synopsis of his 
work and personal experiences in 
Africa, during a panel which in- 

cluded Rev, F. 0, Raines and Mrs. 
DeBaptiste Carr, both familiar 
with the African scene. . 

The Klay Liberia Mission Club 

supports Dr. H, H.: Jones in Klay, 
Liberia. Dr. Jones conducts a 

school for Liberians in which he 
teaches country development, agri- 
cultural and industrial 
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